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Alistair Forbes

From: S R Cladding Services Ltd <srcladding@aol.com>
Sent: 03 January 2018 12:27

To: Alistair Forbes

Subject: Re: Katherine House. Ruckholt Road. .

Further to your email regarding the replacement of 4no. Danpalon panels at the above site we are writing
to confirm the cost for removal of the existing and replacing with new.

Our cost for this work = £4987.42 +Vat

All access will need to be provided by yourselves free of charge to us along with any road /lane closures
whilst the work is carried out.

Materials are on 6 to 8 weeks delivery from receipt of an official order. Once we have an order in the system
we may be able to improve on this delivery period.

We shall require free storage for materials, power, parking for our vehicles and welfare facilities.

Our price is nett.
Our price is subject to Vat.
Our price remains fixed for two months.

Payment terms 21 days from our invoice date.

We trust the above price is of interest to yourself but should you have any queries then please do not hesitate
to contact the writer.

Yours Faithfully

For S R Cladding Services Ltd
Stephen Danforth
www.srcladding.co.uk

Telno. 0161 776 9776

Fax no. 0161 776 9779
Mobile No. 07734 874872

From: Alistair Forbes <alistair@forbesassociates.co.uk>

To: srcladding <srcladding@aol.com>

Sent: Tue, 2 Jan 2018 11:11

Subject: RE: Katherine House. Ruckholt Road. FAO Mr Stephen Danforth.
Hi Stephen

Could you forward your quote please? When we spoke before Christmas you were working on it, and we could do with it
asap to move the project forward..

Many thanks

Alistair



